
BID TABULATION

ITB NO. 99-18, MAINTENANCE COPIERS

DOROTHEA ROBINSON, PRINCIPAL BUYER

205-521-7593

robinsond@jccal.org
1 2 3 4

AMERITEK DOCUMENT SOLTIONS BERNEY OFFICE SOLUTIONS DEX IMAGING ELECTRONIC RICKS CONSULTANTS, INC

DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE

GROUP 1 - SHARP

Item 1: NO BID NO BID

Sharp Copier, Model SF2540

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.040 $81.00 

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.375 $112.00 

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.350 $225.00 

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.040 $0.022 

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy n/a N/A

Item 2: NO BID NO BID

Sharp Copier, Model AR286

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.040 $78.00

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.375 $134.00

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.350 $268.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.040 $0.22

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy n/a N/A

Item 3: NO BID NO BID

Sharp Copier, Model AR250

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.040 $78.00

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.375 $134.00

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.350 $268.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.040 $0.22

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy n/a N/A

Item 4: NO BID NO BID

Sharp Copier, Model SF2040

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.040 $81.00 

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.375 $112.00 

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.350 $225.00 

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.040 $0.022 

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy n/a N/A

Item 5: NO BID NO BID

Sharp Copier, Model AR-M620N

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.0175 $52.00

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.0150 $70.00

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.0135 $135.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.0175 $0.02

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy n/a N/A

Item 6: NO BID NO BID NO BID

Sharp Copier, Model SF2120

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $81.00 

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $112.00 

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $225.00 

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.022 

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy N/A

Item 7: NO BID NO BID

Sharp Copier, Model AM237

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.020 $56.00

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.019 $90.00

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.018 $160.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.020 $0.01

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy n/a N/A

Item 8: NO BID NO BID

Sharp Copier, Model AF205

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.040 $81.00 

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.375 $112.00 

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.350 $225.00 

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.040 $0.022 

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy n/a N/A

Item 9: NO BID NO BID

Sharp Copier, Model AR-M550N

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.0175 $48.00

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.0150 $70.00

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.0135 $130.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.0175 $0.01

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy n/a N/A

Item 10: NO BID NO BID

Sharp Copier, Model AR-M455UC

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.019 $56.00

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.018 $90.00

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.017 $160.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.019 $0.01

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy n/a N/A

Item 11: NO BID NO BID

Sharp Copier, Model AR-M455UCT

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.019 $56.00

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.018 $90.00

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.017 $160.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.019 $0.01

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy n/a N/A

Item 12: NO BID NO BID

Sharp Copier, Model AR-M455NB

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.019 $56.00

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.018 $90.00

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.017 $160.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.019 $0.01

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy n/a N/A

Item 13: NO BID NO BID

Sharp Copier, Model AR-M317

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.020 $56.00

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.018 $90.00

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.017 $160.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.020 $0.01

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy n/a N/A

Item 14: NO BID NO BID

Sharp Copier, Model MX4501

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.180 $52.00

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.017 $80.00

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.016 $150.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.018 $0.01

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy $0.100 $0.08

Item 15: NO BID NO BID

Sharp Copier, Model MX-M950

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.0085 $52.00

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.0077 $80.00

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.0070 $150.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.0085 $0.01

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy n/a $0.08

Item 16: NO BID NO BID

Sharp Copier, Model AM257

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $56.00

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.020 $90.00

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.018 $160.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.017 $0.01

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy $0.020 N/A

Item 17: NO BID n/a NO BID

Sharp Copier, Model MX-3100N

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.0175 $52.00

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.0165 $80.00

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $0.0158 $150.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.0175 $0.01

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy n/a $0.08

GRAND TOTAL OF GROUP I NO BID $2036.00 @ 5000 copies $1,063.00 PER MONTH @ 3000 COPIES

$6,197.00 $3,431.00 @ 5000 COPIES $5,819.00 $1,118.00 per month

YES YES YES YES

YES YES YES YES

YES YES YES YES

YES YES YES YES

YES YES YES YES

YES YES YES YES

YES YES YES YES

Contact Information

Ameritek Document Solutions David Fowler 6205 Al Hwy 69, Guntersville, Alabama 35976 | Phone: 205-856-9925 | dfowler@alabamacopier.com

Berney Office Solutions Mark Brown 10690 John Knigh Close, Montgomery, Alabama 36117 | Phone: 334-271-4750 | mark.brown@berney.com

Dex Imaging Connie Fuell/John Abbott 201 London Parkway, Suite 100, Birmingham, Alabama 35211 | Phone: 205-427-3835/256-666-3339 | john.abbott@deximaging.com

Electronic Risks Consultants Stathis N Zambas 456 Rt. 22 W, Whitehouse Station, NJ 08889 | Phone: 908-823-0960 | bids@erc-corp.com

Statement of Compliance with Alabama Code 31-13-9

Signature Sheet

Price Sheet

Required Forms

GRAND TOTAL OF GROUP I-IV

Notification of Intent to Respond

Equal Opportunity Certification Form

Affidavit of Contractor

Non-Collusion Affidavit



BID TABULATION

ITB NO. 99-18, MAINTENANCE COPIERS

DOROTHEA ROBINSON, PRINCIPAL BUYER

205-521-7593

robinsond@jccal.org
1 2 3 4

AMERITEK DOCUMENT SOLTIONS BERNEY OFFICE SOLUTIONS DEX IMAGING ELECTRONIC RICKS CONSULTANTS, INC

DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE

GROUP II - KONICA MINOLTA COPIERS SHARP

Item 1: NO BID NO BID

  Konica Minolta Bizhub 308

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $16.50 $22.50

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $27.50 $37.50

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $55.00 $75.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.0055 $0.0075

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy N/A $0.055

Item 2: NO BID NO BID

 Konica Minolta Bizhub C360

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $33.00 $22.50

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $55.00 $37.50

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $110.00 $75.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.011 $0.0075

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy $0.055 $0.055

Item 3: NO BID NO BID

Konica Minolta Bizhub 363

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $33.00 $22.50

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $55.00 $37.50

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $110.00 $75.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.011 $0.0075

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy $0.055 $0.055

Item 4: NO BID NO BID

Konica Minolta Bizhub 368

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $16.50 $22.50

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $27.50 $37.50

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $55.00 $75.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.0055 $0.0075

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy N/A $0.055

Item 5: NO BID NO BID

  Konica Minolta Bizhub 423

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $33.00 $22.50

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $55.00 $37.50

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $110.00 $75.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.011 $0.0075

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy $0.055 $0.0550

Item 6: NO BID NO BID

 Konica Minolta Bizhub 454e

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $21.00 $22.50

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $35.00 $37.50

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $70.00 $75.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.007 $0.0075

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy $0.055 $0.0550

Item 7: NO BID NO BID

Konica Minolta Bizhub C454

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $21.00 $22.50

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $35.00 $37.50

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $70.00 $75.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.007 $0.0075

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy $0.055 $0.0550

Item 8: NO BID NO BID

Konica Minolta Bizhub C454e

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $21.00 $22.50

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $35.00 $37.50

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $70.00 $75.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.007 $0.0075

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy $0.055 $0.0550

Item 9: NO BID NO BID

Konica Minolta Bizhub C458

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $16.50 $22.50

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $27.50 $37.50

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $55.00 $75.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.0055 $0.0075

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy N/A $0.0550

Item 10: NO BID NO BID

Konica Minolta Bizhub 552

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $33.00 $22.50

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $55.00 $37.50

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $110.00 $75.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.011 $0.0075

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy $0.055 $0.0550

Item 11: NO BID NO BID

Konica Minolta Bizhub C552

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $33.00 $22.50

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $55.00 $37.50

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $110.00 $75.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.011 $0.0075

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy $0.055 $0.0550

Item 12: NO BID NO BID

Konica Minolta Bizhub 554e

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $21.00 $22.50

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $35.00 $37.50

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $70.00 $75.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.007 $0.0075

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy $0.055 $0.0550

Item 13: NO BID NO BID

Konica Minolta Bizhub C554e

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $21.00 $22.50

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $35.00 $37.50

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $70.00 $75.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.007 $0.0075

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy $0.055 $0.0550

Item 14: NO BID NO BID

Konica Minolta Bizhub 652

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $33.00 $22.50

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $55.00 $37.50

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $110.00 $75.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.011 $0.0075

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy $0.055 $0.0550

Item 15: NO BID NO BID

Konica Minolta Bizhub C652

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $33.00 $22.50

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $55.00 $37.50

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $110.00 $75.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.011 $0.0075

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy $0.055 $0.0550

Item 16: NO BID NO BID

 Konica Minolta Bizhub 654e

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $27.00 $22.50

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $45.00 $37.50

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________per month $90.00 $75.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.009 $0.0075

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy n/a $0.0550

Item 17: NO BID NO BID

Konica Minolta Bizhub C654

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $24.00 $22.50

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $40.00 $37.50

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $80.00 $75.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.008 $0.0075

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy $0.055 $0.0550

Item 18: NO BID NO BID

Konica Minolta Bizhub C654e

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $24.00 $22.50

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $40.00 $37.50

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ copy $80.00 $75.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.008 $0.0075

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy $0.055 $0.0550

Item 19: NO BID NO BID

Konica Minolta Bizhub C658

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $21.00 $22.50

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $35.00 $37.50

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $70.00 $75.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.007 $0.0075

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy $0.055 $0.0550

Item 20: NO BID NO BID

Konica Minolta Bizhub 754e

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $21.00 $22.50

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $35.00 $37.50

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $70.00 $75.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.007 $0.0075

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy $0.055 $0.0550

Item 21: NO BID $22.5000 NO BID

Konica Minolta Bizhub C754e

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $21.00 $22.50

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $35.00 $37.50

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $70.00 $75.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.007 $0.0075

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy $0.055 $0.0550

Item 22: NO BID NO BID

Konica Minolta Bizhub 808

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $18.00 $22.50

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $30.00 $37.50

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $60.00 $75.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.006 $0.0075

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy $0.055 $0.0550

Item 23: NO BID NO BID

Konica Minolta Bizhub PRO 951

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $15.00 $22.50

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $25.00 $37.50

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $50.00 $75.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.005 $0.0075

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy N/A $0.0550

GROUP II GRAND TOTAL $3,339.00 NO BID $3,105.00 NO BID
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AMERITEK DOCUMENT SOLTIONS BERNEY OFFICE SOLUTIONS DEX IMAGING ELECTRONIC RICKS CONSULTANTS, INC

DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE

GROUP III - XEROX COPIERS

Item 1: NO BID NO BID NO BID

Xerox Copier, Model 5855

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $0.010

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $0.009

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $0.008

Copies overage (base rate) $0.010

If applicable, color copies rate N/A

Item 2: NO BID NO BID NO BID

Xerox Copier, Model 5830

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $0.010

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $0.009

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $0.008

Copies overage (base rate) $0.010

If applicable, color copies rate N/A

Item 3: NO BID NO BID NO BID

Xerox Copier, Model 5855C

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $0.010

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $0.009

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $0.008

  Color copies rate $0.010

Copies overage (base rate) N/A

Item 4: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Xerox Copier, Model 8830

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies

Copies overage (base rate)

If applicable, color copies rate

Item 5: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Xerox Copier, Model 8830

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies

Copies overage (base rate)

If applicable, color copies rate

Item 6: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Xerox Copier, Model XC23AS

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies

Copies overage (base rate)

If applicable, color copies rate

Item 7: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Xerox Copier, Model XPC8830-400

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies

Copies overage (base rate)

If applicable, color copies rate

Item 8: NO BID NO BID NO BID

Xerox Copier, Model 5638

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $0.01

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $0.01

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $0.01

Copies overage (base rate) $0.01

If applicable, color copies rate N/A

Item 9: NO BID NO BID NO BID

Xerox Copier, Model 5645

Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $0.01

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $0.01

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $0.01

Copies overage (base rate) $0.01

If applicable, color copies rate N/A

Item 10: NO BID NO BID NO BID

Xerox Copier, Model 4150

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $0.0155

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $0.0150

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $0.0175

Copies overage (base rate) $0.0155

If applicable, color copies rate N/A

Item 11: NO BID NO BID NO BID

Xerox Copier, Model 5655

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $0.0155

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $0.0150

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $0.0175

Copies overage (base rate) $0.0155

If applicable, color copies rate N/A

Item 12: NO BID NO BID NO BID

Xerox Copier, Model 5665

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $0.0155

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $0.0150

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $0.0175

Copies overage (base rate) $0.0155

If applicable, color copies rate N/A

Item 13: NO BID NO BID NO BID

Xerox Copier, Model 5675

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $0.0120

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $0.0100

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $0.0095

Copies overage (base rate) $0.0120

If applicable, color copies rate N/A

Item 14: NO BID NO BID NO BID

Xerox Copier, Model 5687

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $0.0120

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $0.0100

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $0.0095

Copies overage (base rate) $0.0120

If applicable, color copies rate N/A

Item 15: NO BID NO BID NO BID

Xerox Copier, Model 5225

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $0.018

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $0.017

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $0.016

Copies overage (base rate) $0.018

If applicable, color copies rate N/A

Item 16: NO BID NO BID NO BID

Xerox Copier, Model 5632

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $0.014

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $0.012

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $0.010

Copies overage (base rate) $0.014

If applicable, color copies rate N/A

Item 17: NO BID NO BID NO BID

Xerox Copier, Model 4595

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $0.0070

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $0.0065

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $0.0060

Copies overage (base rate) $0.0070

If applicable, color copies rate N/A

Item 18: NO BID

Xerox Copier, Model 4112 NO BID NO BID

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $0.0070

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $0.0065

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $0.0060

Copies overage (base rate) $0.0070

If applicable, color copies rate N/A

Item 19: NO BID

Xerox Copier, Model 7232 NO BID NO BID NO BID

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies

Copies overage (base rate)

If applicable, color copies rate

Item 20: NO BID

Xerox Copier, Model 7335 NO BID NO BID

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $0.0140

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $0.0125

Copies overage (base rate) $0.0110

If applicable, color copies rate $0.0140

Item 21: $0.0900 NO BID

Xerox Copier, Model 7345 NO BID NO BID

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $0.0140

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $0.0125

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $0.0110

Copies overage (base rate) $0.0140

If applicable, color copies rate $0.0900

Item 22: NO BID

Xerox Copier, Model 7655 NO BID NO BID

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $0.0120

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $0.0105

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $0.0095

Copies overage (base rate) $0.0120

If applicable, color copies rate $0.0800

Item 23: NO BID

Xerox Copier, Model 7665 NO BID NO BID

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $0.0120

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $0.0105

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $0.0095

Copies overage (base rate) $0.0120

If applicable, color copies rate $0.0800

Item 24:

Xerox Copier, Model 7675 NO BID NO BID NO BID

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $0.0120

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $0.0105

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $0.0095

Copies overage (base rate) $0.0120

If applicable, color copies rate $0.0800

Item 25:

Xerox Copier, Model 7775 NO BID NO BID NO BID

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $0.0120

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $0.0105

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $0.0095

Copies overage (base rate) $0.0120

If applicable, color copies rate $0.0800

Item 26:

Xerox Copier, Model 5775 NO BID NO BID NO BID

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $0.0100

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $0.0095

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $0.0089

Copies overage (base rate) $0.1000

If applicable, color copies rate N/A

Item 27:

Xerox Copier, Model 5335PT NO BID NO BID NO BID

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $0.01200

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $0.01050

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $0.00985

Copies overage (base rate) $0.01200

If applicable, color copies rate N/A

Item 28:

Xerox Copier, Model 7855PT NO BID NO BID NO BID

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $0.0090

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $0.0083

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $0.0075

Copies overage (base rate) $0.0090

If applicable, color copies rate $0.0850

Item 29:

Xerox Copier, Model 5225 NO BID NO BID NO BID

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $0.018

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $0.017

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $0.016

Copies overage (base rate) $0.180

If applicable, color copies rate N/A

Item 30:

Xerox Copier, Model 5745 NO BID NO BID NO BID

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $0.0110

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $0.0097

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $0.0089

Copies overage (base rate) $0.1100

If applicable, color copies rate N/A

Item 31:

Xerox Copier, Model 5765 NO BID NO BID NO BID

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $0.0110

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $0.0097

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $0.0089

Copies overage (base rate) $0.1100

If applicable, color copies rate N/A

Item 32:

Xerox Copier, Model 5755 NO BID NO BID NO BID

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $0.0110

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $0.0097

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $0.0089

Copies overage (base rate) $0.1100

If applicable, color copies rate N/A

Item 33:

Xerox Copier, Model 5790 NO BID NO BID NO BID

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $0.1050

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $0.0092

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $0.0087

Copies overage (base rate) $0.0105

If applicable, color copies rate N/A

Item 34:

Xerox Copier, Model 9201 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies

Copies overage (base rate)

If applicable, color copies rate

GROUP III GRAND TOTAL NO BID $1395.00 @ 5000 copies NO BID NO BID



BID TABULATION

ITB NO. 99-18, MAINTENANCE COPIERS

DOROTHEA ROBINSON, PRINCIPAL BUYER

205-521-7593

robinsond@jccal.org
1 2 3 4

AMERITEK DOCUMENT SOLTIONS BERNEY OFFICE SOLUTIONS DEX IMAGING ELECTRONIC RICKS CONSULTANTS, INC

DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE
GROUP IV- MURATEC

Item 1: NO BID NO BID NO BID

Muratec Copier, Model 2550

  Base Rate @ 3,000 copies $_______________ per month $55.00

  Base Rate @ 5,000 copies $_______________ per month $96.00

  Base Rate @ 10,000 copies $_______________ per month $146.00

Copies overage (base rate) $_______________ copy $0.01

If applicable, color copies rate $_______________ copy N/A

GROUP IV GRAND TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID $55.00 PER MONTH @ 3000 COPIES


